



Water Works & Sewer Board of the Town of Parrish, AL

Lagoon- addition of chlorination and dechlorination system, and addition of an aerator

H & D Project No. 1078-02

Bid Date: Thursday January 14, 2016, at 2:00 pm local time

Bid Tabulation

				Double Diamond Construction Company Inc		Craig Construction Company		J&P Construction Company, Inc		Mark Johnson Construction, LLC		Rev Construction, Inc	
				3200 38th Stret Northport AL 35473		835 Wall Street Florence AL 35630		PO Drawer 3147 Tuscaloosa AL 35403		480 28th Ave Suite 300 Tuscaloosa AL35401		2201 11th Street Tuscaloosa AL 35401	
BASE BID				Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
Item	Description	Qty	Unit										
1	2" PVC water line from the road complete with all valves, valve boxes, PRV, fittings and road boring and 1" water service to the buiding	1	LS	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 21,320.00	\$ 21,320.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 30,500.00	\$ 30,500.00	\$ 29,000.00	\$ 29,000.00
2	Two pre-cast concrete square boxes, removal of concrete pipe, and new 36" RCP, installed	1	LS	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 28,300.00	\$ 28,300.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 23,000.00
3	Aggregate Piers	1	LS	\$ 49,600.00	\$ 49,600.00	\$ 66,600.00	\$ 66,600.00	\$ 65,000.00	\$ 65,000.00	\$ 68,000.00	\$ 68,000.00	\$ 48,000.00	\$ 48,000.00
4	Concrete Chlorine Contact Tank with foundation and all accessories such as handrails and grout	1	LS	\$ 79,700.00	\$ 79,700.00	\$ 66,800.00	\$ 66,800.00	\$ 197,000.00	\$ 197,000.00	\$ 74,000.00	\$ 74,000.00	\$ 47,000.00	\$ 47,000.00
5	Prefabricated Building and Foundation	1	LS	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 44,800.00	\$ 44,800.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 48,000.00	\$ 48,000.00	\$ 32,000.00	\$ 32,000.00
6	Chemical Feed System in the building and piping to the contact tank. (Base bid for Chemical Injection Technologies)	1	LS	\$ 38,000.00	\$ 38,000.00	\$ 53,000.00	\$ 53,000.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 49,000.00	\$ 49,000.00	\$ 54,000.00	\$ 54,000.00
7	Site work including sidewalk, drain line from the contact tank, grading, sediment and erosion control and seeding and strawing	1	LS	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 43,250.00	\$ 43,250.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00
8	Electrical and controls system upgrades (not part of aerator installation)	1	LS	\$ 12,700.00	\$ 12,700.00	\$ 20,900.00	\$ 20,900.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 32,000.00	\$ 32,000.00
9	Installation of one Aerator including mounting system, electrical system and safety items	1	LS	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 33,200.00	\$ 33,200.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00
10	Mobilization and Bonds	1	LS	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00
11	Additional Work Where Directed by Engineer with Approved Work Directive	1	LS	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00
<b>Total Base Bid</b>				<b>\$ 316,000.00</b>	<b>\$ 316,000.00</b>	<b>\$ 397,920.00</b>	<b>\$ 397,920.00</b>	<b>\$ 512,000.00</b>	<b>\$ 512,000.00</b>	<b>\$ 453,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 453,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 344,000.00</b>	<b>\$ 344,000.00</b>

				Double Diamond Construction		Craig Construction Co		J&P Construction Co		Mark Johnson Construction		Rev Construction Inc	
				3200 38th Stret Northport AL 35473		835 Wall Street Florence AL 35630		PO Drawer 3147 Tuscaloosa AL 35403		480 28th Ave Suite 300 Tuscaloosa AL35401		2201 11th Street Tuscaloosa AL 35401	
Item	Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
ALTERNATE 1: Chemical feed systems by Wallace and Tiernan - Additive													
1	Chemical feed systems by Wallace and Tiernan	1	LS	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Total Alternate 1 (additive)				\$	15,000.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Total Base Bid Plus Alternate 1				\$	331,000.00	\$	512,000.00	\$	453,750.00	\$	344,000.00		

				Owner/Engineer									
Item	Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
ALTERNATE 2: Chemical feed systems by Capital Controls - Additive													
1	Chemical feed systems by Capital Controls	1	LS	\$ (2,000.00)	\$ (2,000.00)	\$ (5,000.00)	\$ (5,000.00)	NO BID	NO BID	\$ (3,500.00)	\$ (3,500.00)	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
Total Alternate 2 (additive)				\$	(2,000.00)	\$	(5,000.00)	\$	-	\$	(3,500.00)	\$	1,000.00
Total Base Bid Plus Alternate 2				\$	314,000.00	\$	392,920.00	\$	512,000.00	\$	450,250.00	\$	345,000.00

				Owner/Engineer									
Item	Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
ALTERNATE 3: Do not install aerators - Deductive													
1	Do not install aerators	1	LS	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 32,000.00	\$ 32,000.00
Total Alternate 3 (deductive)				\$	5,000.00	\$	30,000.00	\$	3,000.00	\$	35,000.00	\$	32,000.00
Total Base Bid Plus ( lowest of Alternates 1 and 2), Less Alternate 3				\$	309,000.00	\$	362,920.00	\$	509,000.00	\$	415,250.00	\$	313,000.00

Corrected For Math Error

I do hereby certify this to be a true and correct representation of the bids.

*Reg Harris*  
Reg Harris, PE

